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The Choctaw language, indigenous to the southeastern United States, now with its greatest concentrations
ofspeakers in Missis sippi, Oklahoma, and Los Angeles, has in the main escaped the
scrutinyoftheoreticallinguistics.ItisnotthatChoctaw isanintrin sicallyuninterestinglanguage-
aquickglanceataclausewithfive agreement controllers and a mismatch between the caseofafree
standingnominaland its agreement affix should dispelthat notion. Rather it is, I think, the question of what we
can learn from a languageinwhichNPsdon'tmovearound,"WHs"don'tfront, and gaps simply arise from
pronominalization. My hope is that the presentvolume,takentogetherwithagrowingliteraturespurredon by the
workofPamMunro and her students atUCLA, will bring Choctawintothelightofdayand into the
circleoflanguagescon sidered when constructing theories that define "possible human language".
Thepresentstudy,arevisionofmy 1981dissertation(University
ofCalifornia,SanDiego),focusesfirstandforemostontheChoctaw
agreementsystem,takingthisasthekeytothestructureofChoctaw syntax. The immediate goal, then, is to provide
a unified account ofthestructures and rules underlyingtheagreement system.Along the way a
rangeofgrammatical phenomena is examined, taken as evidence for particular structural configurations, and
incorporated into awell-integratedaccountofmorphologicaland syntacticfacts. The resultsbearon anumber
ofcurrent issues, includingthe Un accusative Hypothesis, the existence of demotions, the nature of
antipassive, disjunctive rule application, universals of causative constructions, and others.For these reasons
Choctawdeserves the scrutinyoftheoreticians. The data forming the corpus for analysis represent a variety of
Oklahoma Choctaw.They were collected from a nativespeaker in San Diego between 1978 and 1982 and
from various speakers in Oklahoma during two extended visits to Broken Bow in 1980. I lX PREFACE x
wishtothankthespeakerswhohelpedmebysharingtheirlanguage
andencouragingmystudies.MyworkonChoctawwassupportedin partbyfundsfrom
theNationalScienceFoundation(throughgrant numberBNS78-17498totheUniversityofCalifornia,SanDiego),
theAmericanPhilosophicalSociety(throughaPhillipsFundgrant), andtheDepartmentofLinguisticsatUCSD.
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From reader reviews:

Joe Bell:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not require people to be aware of each details they get. How many people to be
smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Studying a book
can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Choctaw Verb Agreement and
Universal Grammar (Studies in Natural Language and Linguistic Theory) book because this book offers you
rich info and knowledge. Of course the data in this book hundred percent guarantees there is no doubt in it
everbody knows.

Carol Hamilton:

The ability that you get from Choctaw Verb Agreement and Universal Grammar (Studies in Natural
Language and Linguistic Theory) will be the more deep you rooting the information that hide inside words
the more you get considering reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to recognise but Choctaw Verb
Agreement and Universal Grammar (Studies in Natural Language and Linguistic Theory) giving you thrill
feeling of reading. The article author conveys their point in particular way that can be understood through
anyone who read the item because the author of this guide is well-known enough. That book also makes your
personal vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to understand then can go to you, both in printed or e-
book style are available. We advise you for having this particular Choctaw Verb Agreement and Universal
Grammar (Studies in Natural Language and Linguistic Theory) instantly.

David Gonzales:

This Choctaw Verb Agreement and Universal Grammar (Studies in Natural Language and Linguistic
Theory) are usually reliable for you who want to be a successful person, why. The key reason why of this
Choctaw Verb Agreement and Universal Grammar (Studies in Natural Language and Linguistic Theory) can
be among the great books you must have is definitely giving you more than just simple reading through food
but feed an individual with information that maybe will shock your prior knowledge. This book is handy,
you can bring it everywhere and whenever your conditions throughout the e-book and printed kinds. Beside
that this Choctaw Verb Agreement and Universal Grammar (Studies in Natural Language and Linguistic
Theory) giving you an enormous of experience such as rich vocabulary, giving you demo of critical thinking
that we all know it useful in your day exercise. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Robert Poulin:

You may get this Choctaw Verb Agreement and Universal Grammar (Studies in Natural Language and
Linguistic Theory) by look at the bookstore or Mall. Merely viewing or reviewing it may to be your solve
difficulty if you get difficulties for your knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only through
written or printed and also can you enjoy this book by means of e-book. In the modern era similar to now,



you just looking by your local mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your
current ways to get more information about your publication. It is most important to arrange yourself to
make your knowledge are still update. Let's try to choose right ways for you.
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