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Specially priced Box Set of Envy and Betrayal, books I and II of the Empty Coffin Series.

Envy, Book I, Empty Coffin Series
New York Times bestselling adult true crime author Gregg Olsen takes readers to Empty Coffin,
Washington, in a gripping new fiction series for teens based on ripped-from-the-headlines stories…with a
paranormal touch.

Crime lives--and dies--in the deceptively picture-perfect town of Port Gamble (aka “Empty Coffin”),
Washington. Evil lurks and strange things happen--and 15-year-olds Hayley and Taylor Ryan secretly use
their wits and their telepathic “twin-sense” to uncover the truth about the town's victims and culprits.

Envy, the series debut, involves the mysterious death of the twins' old friend, Katelyn. Was it murder?
Suicide? An accident? Hayley and Taylor are determined to find out--and as they investigate, they stumble
upon a dark truth that is far more disturbing than they ever could have imagined.

Based on the shocking true crime about cyber-bullying, Envy will take you to the edge--and push you right
over.

Also...

Betrayal, Book Two Empty Coffin Series

In this action-packed thriller sequel to Envy, foreign exchange student Olivia Grant is stabbed to death after
a party--and the prime suspect is her best friend. As twins Hayley and Taylor Ryan get pulled into the
aftermath of this Amanda Knox-like crime, they realize nothing is what it seems. Could it be betrayal of the
ultimate kind?

Betrayal features real-life crime-solving techniques, heart-stopping suspense, plenty of red herrings, hard-
hitting ethical questions, and information about the Amanda Knox case that inspired the novel. As the crime
unravels, so does the twins' past…and they must face off against a family member who may unexpectedly
have carried out the worst betrayal of all
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From reader reviews:

Brent Abramson:

The reason? Because this Empty Coffin Series (Envy and Betrayal Box Set) is an unordinary book that the
inside of the guide waiting for you to snap that but latter it will zap you with the secret the idea inside.
Reading this book next to it was fantastic author who else write the book in such incredible way makes the
content interior easier to understand, entertaining way but still convey the meaning completely. So , it is
good for you because of not hesitating having this anymore or you going to regret it. This excellent book will
give you a lot of benefits than the other book have such as help improving your expertise and your critical
thinking method. So , still want to delay having that book? If I were being you I will go to the guide store
hurriedly.

Melissa Sanders:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with pals is thing that usually
you could have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try factor that really opposite from
that. One activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you have been
ride on and with addition info. Even you love Empty Coffin Series (Envy and Betrayal Box Set), it is
possible to enjoy both. It is good combination right, you still desire to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is
it? Oh come on its mind hangout folks. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on its called reading friends.

Fern Gooding:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside with friends, fun activity along with family or just
watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by studying a book.
Ugh, do you think reading a book will surely hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It ok you
can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Empty Coffin Series (Envy and
Betrayal Box Set) which is obtaining the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's see.

David Gilbert:

You may get this Empty Coffin Series (Envy and Betrayal Box Set) by check out the bookstore or Mall. Just
simply viewing or reviewing it might to be your solve difficulty if you get difficulties on your knowledge.
Kinds of this book are various. Not only simply by written or printed and also can you enjoy this book by
simply e-book. In the modern era including now, you just looking of your mobile phone and searching what
their problem. Right now, choose your current ways to get more information about your guide. It is most
important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still update. Let's try to choose right ways
for you.
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