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Considered by many the greatest of the classic Greek tragedies, Oedipus Rex is Sophocles' finest play and a
work of extraordinary power and resonance. Aristotle considered it a masterpiece of dramatic construction
and refers to it frequently in the Poetics.
In presenting the story of King Oedipus and the tragedy that ensues when he discovers he has inadvertently
killed his father and married his mother, the play exhibits near-perfect harmony of character and action.
Moreover, the masterly use of dramatic irony greatly intensifies the impact of the agonizing events and
emotions experienced by Oedipus and the other characters in the play. Now these and many other facets of
this towering tragedy may be studied and appreciated in Dover's attractive inexpensive edition of one of the
great landmarks of Western drama.
A selection of the Common Core State Standards Initiative.
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From reader reviews:

Edna Kopec:

The book Oedipus Rex (Dover Thrift Editions) give you a sense of feeling enjoy for your spare time. You
should use to make your capable much more increase. Book can for being your best friend when you getting
pressure or having big problem with your subject. If you can make reading a book Oedipus Rex (Dover
Thrift Editions) being your habit, you can get far more advantages, like add your own personal capable,
increase your knowledge about many or all subjects. You can know everything if you like available and read
a book Oedipus Rex (Dover Thrift Editions). Kinds of book are several. It means that, science reserve or
encyclopedia or other individuals. So , how do you think about this e-book?

Roxanne Jimenez:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive currently,
people have do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and
notice by means of surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated the idea for a
while is reading. Yes, by reading a e-book your ability to survive raise then having chance to stand than other
is high. For you personally who want to start reading the book, we give you this Oedipus Rex (Dover Thrift
Editions) book as nice and daily reading book. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Jacob King:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you will have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try matter that really opposite
from that. 1 activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
are ride on and with addition info. Even you love Oedipus Rex (Dover Thrift Editions), it is possible to enjoy
both. It is very good combination right, you still want to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh
seriously its mind hangout men. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on its identified as reading friends.

Sheila Gallagher:

Do you have something that that suits you such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to select book
like comic, brief story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not hoping Oedipus Rex (Dover Thrift
Editions) that give your fun preference will be satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading routine all over
the world can be said as the method for people to know world better then how they react towards the world.
It can't be explained constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky particular person but for all of you
who wants to possibly be success person. So , for all you who want to start reading through as your good
habit, it is possible to pick Oedipus Rex (Dover Thrift Editions) become your own starter.
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