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“Smith gets the details of mid-level rock stardom just right … mixing laughs and satire like a cross between
Carl Hiaasen and Ross Thomas. A-” —Entertainment Weekly

From the author of Moist and Delicious comes a raucous comic novel where anything goes. Turk Henry, an
overweight, unemployed rock star married to a supermodel, has discovered that Thailand is probably the last
place a recovering sex addict should go on vacation, yet here he is, surrounded by topless groupies and
haunted by the stares of hundreds of luscious bar girls. Turk’s struggles with monogamy, however, pale
beside a greater challenge when his wife is abducted by a group of renegade, shipless Thai pirates. As Turk,
whose life skills are limited to playing bass and partying, navigates the back alleys of Bangkok and the
deadly jungles of Southeast Asia to save his wife, Salty heats up and sweats bullets. Featuring skinflint
American tourists, topless beaches, a hypochondriac U.S. government agent, suitcases loaded with cash, an
over-eager full-service personal assistant, a horny Australian commando, inventive prostitutes, and an urbane
pirate with a fetish for alabaster skin, this is a hilariously entertaining, thoroughly debauched caper novel —
with a happy finish.
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From reader reviews:

Frank Hegarty:

The book Salty: A Novel give you a sense of feeling enjoy for your spare time. You can utilize to make your
capable considerably more increase. Book can for being your best friend when you getting anxiety or having
big problem with the subject. If you can make looking at a book Salty: A Novel for being your habit, you can
get more advantages, like add your own personal capable, increase your knowledge about some or all
subjects. You are able to know everything if you like open up and read a guide Salty: A Novel. Kinds of
book are several. It means that, science publication or encyclopedia or others. So , how do you think about
this book?

Shameka Nye:

What do you think about book? It is just for students because they are still students or that for all people in
the world, what best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that query above. Every person has
different personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they don't
want do that. You must know how great and important the book Salty: A Novel. All type of book can you
see on many resources. You can look for the internet options or other social media.

Rose Hilton:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and
soon. You can view that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. Typically the book that
recommended to you is Salty: A Novel this book consist a lot of the information of the condition of this
world now. That book was represented how can the world has grown up. The language styles that writer use
to explain it is easy to understand. The actual writer made some study when he makes this book. This is why
this book acceptable all of you.

Tracy Zapata:

As a university student exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the
library in order to make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's
heart or real their interest. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to go to the library. They go to
generally there but nothing reading critically. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring along
with can't see colorful images on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important to suit your
needs. As we know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word
says, ways to reach Chinese's country. So , this Salty: A Novel can make you sense more interested to read.
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